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After the 9/11 Commission concluded in 2004 that the U.S. was engaged in a war with terrorists and never
realized it, they reasoned that “a failure of imagination” had prevented us from seeing terrorism coming. In
effect, Americans were simply unable, or in fact disabled, to fathom that there were people who hated and
opposed our democracy with such ferocity. But after billions of dollars and almost a decade fighting a war in
the Middle East, will we miss the threat again?

With penetrating insight and candor, Walid Phares, Fox News terrorism and Middle East expert and a
specialist in global strategies, argues that a fierce race for control of the Middle East is on, and the world’s
future may depend on the outcome. Yet not a failure of imagination, but rather, of education has left
Americans without essential information on the real roots of the rising Jihadi threat. Western democracies
display a dangerous misunderstanding of precisely who opposes democracy and why. In fact, the West
ignores the wide and disparate forces within the Muslim world—including a brotherhood against democracy
that is fighting to bring the region under totalitarian control—and crucially underestimates the determined
generation of youth feverishly waging a grassroots revolution toward democracy and human rights.

As terror strikes widen from Manhattan to Mumbai and battlefields rage from Afghanistan to Iraq, many
tough questions are left unanswered, or even explored: Where are the anti-Jihadists and the democrats in the
Muslim world? Does the Middle East really reject democracy? Do the peoples of the region prefer the
Taliban, the Muslim Brotherhood, or Hezbollah over liberals and seculars? And is there really no genuine
hope that freedom and democracy can prevail over the Islamist caliphate?

Phares explores how the free world can indeed win the conflict with the Jihadists, but he says, not by using
the tactics, policies, and strategies it has employed so far. He urges policy makers to first identify the threat
and define its ideology, or there will be no victory.

The Coming Revolution is a vital corrective step in the world’s war against terrorism and essential reading
that clearly and explosively illustrates the untold story of a struggle to determine if the Middle East can at
last reach freedom in this century—or if this planet can prevent the otherwise inevitable outcome that could
change our social and political landscape forever. The race is on.
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From reader reviews:

Harold Felix:

The book The Coming Revolution: Struggle for Freedom in the Middle East give you a sense of feeling
enjoy for your spare time. You should use to make your capable more increase. Book can for being your best
friend when you getting tension or having big problem using your subject. If you can make looking at a book
The Coming Revolution: Struggle for Freedom in the Middle East to be your habit, you can get considerably
more advantages, like add your current capable, increase your knowledge about many or all subjects. You
are able to know everything if you like available and read a book The Coming Revolution: Struggle for
Freedom in the Middle East. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science guide or encyclopedia or other
individuals. So , how do you think about this reserve?

Aida Zambrana:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading
behavior give you lot of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge the actual information
inside the book which improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind
of reserve you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want really
feel happy read one having theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. The The Coming Revolution:
Struggle for Freedom in the Middle East is kind of reserve which is giving the reader unstable experience.

Irene Robertson:

You could spend your free time to learn this book this publication. This The Coming Revolution: Struggle
for Freedom in the Middle East is simple to develop you can read it in the area, in the beach, train in addition
to soon. If you did not include much space to bring typically the printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is
make you easier to read it. You can save the book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of
benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Yolanda Sartain:

You may get this The Coming Revolution: Struggle for Freedom in the Middle East by go to the bookstore
or Mall. Merely viewing or reviewing it may to be your solve challenge if you get difficulties for the
knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are various. Not only by written or printed but also can you enjoy this book
through e-book. In the modern era such as now, you just looking of your mobile phone and searching what
your problem. Right now, choose your personal ways to get more information about your guide. It is most
important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still revise. Let's try to choose suitable ways
for you.
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