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If you want to make thoughtful but practical decisions about the measurement of health constructs, look no
further than Dr. Polit and Dr. Yang’s latest book, a “gentle” introduction to and overview of complex
measurement content, called Measurement and the Measurement of Change.
 
This book is for researchers and clinicians from all health disciplines because measurement is vital to high-
quality science and to excellence in clinical practice. The text focuses on the measurement of health
constructs, particularly those constructs that are not amenable to quantification by means of laboratory
analysis or technical instrumentation. These health constructs include a wide range of human attributes, such
as quality of life, functional ability, self-efficacy, depression, and pain. Measures of such constructs are
proliferating at a rapid rate and often without adequate attention paid to ensuring that standards of scientific
rigor are met. In this book, the authors offer guidance to those who develop new instruments, adapt existing
ones, select instruments for use in a clinical trial or in clinical practice, interpret information from
measurements and changes in scores, or undertake a systematic review on instruments. This book offers
guidance on how to develop new instruments using both “classical” and “modern” approaches from
psychometrics, as well as methods used in clinimetrics. Much of this book, however, concerns the evaluation
of instruments in relation to three key measurement domains: reliability, validity, and responsiveness.
 
This text was designed to be useful in graduate-level courses on measurement or research methods and will
also serve as an important reference and resource for researchers and clinicians.
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From reader reviews:

Micheal McDonough:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you need
something to explain what you problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy person? If you don't
have spare time to perform others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And you have
extra time? What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. The doctor has to answer that
question since just their can do that will. It said that about book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is
suitable. Because start from on pre-school until university need this specific Measurement and the
Measurement of Change to read.

Joe Timmons:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the subject Measurement
and the Measurement of Change suitable to you? Often the book was written by famous writer in this era.
Often the book untitled Measurement and the Measurement of Changeis the main one of several books in
which everyone read now. This specific book was inspired many men and women in the world. When you
read this book you will enter the new dimension that you ever know before. The author explained their
concept in the simple way, so all of people can easily to comprehend the core of this publication. This book
will give you a wide range of information about this world now. In order to see the represented of the world
in this particular book.

Tim Gonzalez:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you, why because this Measurement and the Measurement of Change
e-book written by well-known writer who really knows well how to make book that may be understand by
anyone who read the book. Written in good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and publishing
skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still uncertainty Measurement and the
Measurement of Change as good book not only by the cover but also through the content. This is one guide
that can break don't determine book by its deal with, so do you still needing an additional sixth sense to pick
that!? Oh come on your examining sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to another sixth
sense.

William Sam:

Reading a book for being new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to read a book. When you
learn a book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge, simply
because book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book
that you have read. If you need to get information about your analysis, you can read education books, but if
you act like you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics, and also soon.
The Measurement and the Measurement of Change provide you with a new experience in reading through a



book.
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