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Strategically situated at the gateway to the Mississippi River yet standing atop a former swamp, New Orleans
was from the first what geographer Peirce Lewis called an "impossible but inevitable city." How New
Orleans came to be, taking shape between the mutual and often contradictory forces of nature and urban
development, is the subject of An Unnatural Metropolis. Though all cities must contend with their physical
settings, Craig E. Colten demonstrates that New Orleans may be the city most dependent on human-induced
transformations of its precarious site.

Colten traces engineered modifications to New Orleans’s natural environment from 1800 to 2000. Before the
city could swell in size and commercial importance as its nineteenth-century boosters envisioned, builders
had to wrest it from its waterlogged site, protect it from floods, expel disease, and supply basic services using
local resources. Colten shows how every manipulation of the environment made an impact on the city’s
social geography as well—often with unequal, adverse consequences for minorities—and how each still
requires maintenance and improvement today. For example, while the massive levee system has controlled
the unpredictable Mississippi, it also captures heavy downpours, creating a new set of internal flood
problems. Recent federal regulations and environmental activism have converted the river from a sewage
carrier to a protected water supply, reclassified garbage dumps as hazardous waste sites, and attempted to
restore some of the city’s swamps—but with difficult social and political adjustments.

Urban geographers frequently have portrayed cities as the antithesis of nature, but in An Unnatural
Metropolis Colten inserts a critical environmental perspective to the history of urban areas. His amply
illustrated work offers an in-depth look at a city and society uniquely shaped by the natural forces it has
sought to harness.
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From reader reviews:

Brandon Huff:

The book An Unnatural Metropolis: Wresting New Orleans from Nature can give more knowledge and also
the precise product information about everything you want. So why must we leave a very important thing
like a book An Unnatural Metropolis: Wresting New Orleans from Nature? A number of you have a different
opinion about e-book. But one aim that book can give many details for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right
now, try to closer together with your book. Knowledge or information that you take for that, you are able to
give for each other; you are able to share all of these. Book An Unnatural Metropolis: Wresting New Orleans
from Nature has simple shape however, you know: it has great and big function for you. You can search the
enormous world by open up and read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

Fern Marshall:

The reserve untitled An Unnatural Metropolis: Wresting New Orleans from Nature is the publication that
recommended to you to see. You can see the quality of the book content that will be shown to an individual.
The language that creator use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The writer was did a lot of
research when write the book, to ensure the information that they share to you is absolutely accurate. You
also will get the e-book of An Unnatural Metropolis: Wresting New Orleans from Nature from the publisher
to make you much more enjoy free time.

Alice Rodriguez:

The actual book An Unnatural Metropolis: Wresting New Orleans from Nature has a lot of knowledge on it.
So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was authored by the very
famous author. Mcdougal makes some research previous to write this book. This specific book very easy to
read you may get the point easily after perusing this book.

Judith Bradshaw:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information
quicker to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, newspaper,
book, and soon. You can view that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. Typically the book
that recommended to you personally is An Unnatural Metropolis: Wresting New Orleans from Nature this e-
book consist a lot of the information with the condition of this world now. This particular book was
represented how do the world has grown up. The vocabulary styles that writer use for explain it is easy to
understand. Often the writer made some study when he makes this book. That is why this book suitable all of
you.
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