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At some point over the course of the average American woman’s life, she will find herself alone, whether
she is divorced, widowed, single, or in a loveless, isolating relationship. And when that time comes, it is
likely that she will be at a loss as to how to handle it. As a society, we have an unspoken but omnipresent
belief that a woman alone is an outcast, inherently flawed in some way. In this invigorating, supportive book,
psychotherapist Florence Falk aims to take the fear, doubt, confusion, and helplessness out of being a woman
alone. Falk invites all women to find their own paths toward an authentic selfhood, to discover the pleasures
and riches of solitude, and to reconnect with others through a newfound sense of self-confidence.

Like so many women before her, Florence Falk found herself divorced, alone, and unsure of herself. Soon
she realized that by embracing her solitude for what it was—a potentially enriching and life-altering
experience—she could turn what once would have felt like “loneliness” into a far more positive and
empowered “aloneness.” Falk notes that each of us has two opposing drives: one causes us to yearn to make
close connections with others, and the other pulls us back into ourselves, into the need for selfhood and
certainty that can only be shaped through solitude. In order to be whole, she says, we must heed both of those
impulses. But in our modern culture, the former is stressed while the latter is neglected, even vilified. On My
Own boldly shifts that paradigm.

With inspiring, intimate stories of women from all backgrounds, Falk illuminates the essential role that being
alone plays in women’s lives. Whether she is in a stable relationship or on her own, every woman must learn
to be by herself; for if she can be fully free, unfettered by society’s stigmas about being alone, life and all its
possibilities will open up for her. And as Falk demonstrates, once a woman has discovered the richness of
solitude, she is not likely to give it up so easily.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Cara Fultz:

Within other case, little men and women like to read book On My Own: The Art of Being a Woman Alone.
You can choose the best book if you appreciate reading a book. As long as we know about how is important
the book On My Own: The Art of Being a Woman Alone. You can add understanding and of course you can
around the world by just a book. Absolutely right, because from book you can know everything! From your
country until foreign or abroad you will end up known. About simple thing until wonderful thing it is
possible to know that. In this era, we can open a book or searching by internet device. It is called e-book.
You can utilize it when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's read.

Eddie Bussell:

On My Own: The Art of Being a Woman Alone can be one of your basic books that are good idea. We
recommend that straight away because this publication has good vocabulary that may increase your
knowledge in vocabulary, easy to understand, bit entertaining however delivering the information. The
article author giving his/her effort to get every word into joy arrangement in writing On My Own: The Art of
Being a Woman Alone yet doesn't forget the main point, giving the reader the hottest and based confirm
resource information that maybe you can be considered one of it. This great information can drawn you into
brand-new stage of crucial contemplating.

Carlos Lauzon:

It is possible to spend your free time to read this book this e-book. This On My Own: The Art of Being a
Woman Alone is simple to create you can read it in the area, in the beach, train in addition to soon. If you did
not include much space to bring the actual printed book, you can buy the particular e-book. It is make you
easier to read it. You can save often the book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of benefits
that you will get when you buy this book.

Thomas Ellis:

This On My Own: The Art of Being a Woman Alone is brand new way for you who has curiosity to look for
some information as it relief your hunger associated with. Getting deeper you in it getting knowledge more
you know or perhaps you who still having tiny amount of digest in reading this On My Own: The Art of
Being a Woman Alone can be the light food to suit your needs because the information inside this book is
easy to get simply by anyone. These books build itself in the form that is certainly reachable by anyone,
that's why I mean in the e-book type. People who think that in book form make them feel sleepy even dizzy
this reserve is the answer. So there is not any in reading a e-book especially this one. You can find actually
looking for. It should be here for an individual. So , don't miss that! Just read this e-book sort for your better
life as well as knowledge.
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