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In this collection, leading scholars focus on the contemporary meanings and diverse experiences of blackness
in specific countries of the hemisphere, including the United States. The anthology introduces new
perspectives on comparative forms of racialization in the Americas and presents its implications both for
Latin American societies, and for Latinos' relations with African Americans in the U.S. Contributors address
issues such as: Who are the Afro-Latin Americans? What historical contributions do they bring to their
respective national polities? What happens to their national and socio-racial identities as a result of migration
to the United States? What is the impact of the growing presence of Afro-Latin Americans within U.S.
Latino populations, particularly with respect to the continuing dynamics of racialization in the United States
today? And, more generally, what are the prospects and obstacles for rethinking alliances and coalition-
building between and among racial(ized) minorities and other groups in contemporary U.S. society?
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From reader reviews:

Carroll Torres:

Book is written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can realize everything you want by a guide. Book
has a different type. We all know that that book is important point to bring us around the world. Adjacent to
that you can your reading ability was fluently. A e-book Neither Enemies nor Friends: Latinos, Blacks, Afro-
Latinos will make you to always be smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know about almost
everything. But some of you think that will open or reading a new book make you bored. It's not make you
fun. Why they can be thought like that? Have you trying to find best book or appropriate book with you?

Karyn Turner:

The book Neither Enemies nor Friends: Latinos, Blacks, Afro-Latinos can give more knowledge and
information about everything you want. Exactly why must we leave a very important thing like a book
Neither Enemies nor Friends: Latinos, Blacks, Afro-Latinos? Some of you have a different opinion about
reserve. But one aim in which book can give many information for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right
now, try to closer together with your book. Knowledge or facts that you take for that, it is possible to give for
each other; you may share all of these. Book Neither Enemies nor Friends: Latinos, Blacks, Afro-Latinos has
simple shape but you know: it has great and big function for you. You can appear the enormous world by
start and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Carol Jackson:

Do you considered one of people who can't read gratifying if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold
on guys this kind of aren't like that. This Neither Enemies nor Friends: Latinos, Blacks, Afro-Latinos book is
readable through you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the facts here are arrange for enjoyable
reading experience without leaving actually decrease the knowledge that want to deliver to you. The writer
involving Neither Enemies nor Friends: Latinos, Blacks, Afro-Latinos content conveys the thought easily to
understand by a lot of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the articles but it just different such
as it. So , do you nonetheless thinking Neither Enemies nor Friends: Latinos, Blacks, Afro-Latinos is not
loveable to be your top listing reading book?

Charles Frye:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information currently can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a expertise or any news even an issue. What people must be consider
whenever those information which is from the former life are challenging to be find than now's taking
seriously which one is acceptable to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you have the
unstable resource then you understand it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you.
All of those possibilities will not happen with you if you take Neither Enemies nor Friends: Latinos, Blacks,
Afro-Latinos as the daily resource information.
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