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In programming courses, using the different syntax of multiple languages, such as C++, Java, PHP, and
Python, for the same abstraction often confuses students new to computer science. Introduction to
Programming Languages separates programming language concepts from the restraints of multiple
language syntax by discussing the concepts at an abstract level.

Designed for a one-semester undergraduate course, this classroom-tested book teaches the principles of
programming language design and implementation. It presents:

Common features of programming languages at an abstract level rather than a comparative level●

The implementation model and behavior of programming paradigms at abstract levels so that students●

understand the power and limitations of programming paradigms
Language constructs at a paradigm level●

A holistic view of programming language design and behavior●

To make the book self-contained, the author introduces the necessary concepts of data structures and discrete
structures from the perspective of programming language theory. The text covers classical topics, such as
syntax and semantics, imperative programming, program structures, information exchange between
subprograms, object-oriented programming, logic programming, and functional programming. It also
explores newer topics, including dependency analysis, communicating sequential processes, concurrent
programming constructs, web and multimedia programming, event-based programming, agent-based
programming, synchronous languages, high-productivity programming on massive parallel computers,
models for mobile computing, and much more. Along with problems and further reading in each chapter, the
book includes in-depth examples and case studies using various languages that help students understand
syntax in practical contexts.
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From reader reviews:

Martina Barton:

Book is written, printed, or created for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a e-book.
Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important factor to bring us around the world. Close to that
you can your reading skill was fluently. A guide Introduction to Programming Languages will make you to
possibly be smarter. You can feel much more confidence if you can know about every thing. But some of
you think that open or reading a new book make you bored. It isn't make you fun. Why they can be thought
like that? Have you searching for best book or acceptable book with you?

Marie Boyd:

As people who live in the modest era should be change about what going on or info even knowledge to make
them keep up with the era that is certainly always change and progress. Some of you maybe will update
themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to an individual is you
don't know what type you should start with. This Introduction to Programming Languages is our
recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, because this book serves what you want and
wish in this era.

Helen Green:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people love it. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new
info. When you read a book you will get new information mainly because book is one of various ways to
share the information or even their idea. Second, looking at a book will make you more imaginative. When
you reading through a book especially fictional book the author will bring one to imagine the story how the
people do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to some others. When you read this
Introduction to Programming Languages, it is possible to tells your family, friends as well as soon about
yours book. Your knowledge can inspire the mediocre, make them reading a e-book.

Carol Ramirez:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you could have it
in e-book means, more simple and reachable. This Introduction to Programming Languages can give you a
lot of pals because by you checking out this one book you have factor that they don't and make a person
more like an interesting person. That book can be one of one step for you to get success. This book offer you
information that maybe your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than different make you to be great
people. So , why hesitate? Let's have Introduction to Programming Languages.
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