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Childhood can be an exciting time, full of joyous exploration, new skills, friends, and imaginative play. It
can also be very frightening, especially when children have experiences that threaten their feelings of safety
and well-being. Even common traumatic childhood events can deeply affect children's normal healthy
development, their self-esteem, and their families. Many behavioral problems stemming from common
traumatic events could require years of psychotherapy or medication. That is, they did -- until the advent of
EMDR. Developed by psychologist Francine Shapiro in the late 1980s, EMDR had already helped thousands
of adult clients when Joan Lovett experienced its healing power firsthand. Eye movement desensitization and
reprocessing (EMDR) is a comprehensive therapeutic approach that helps patients release disturbing
thoughts and emotions that originate in traumatic experiences. Experiences can be traumatic in the
commonly accepted sense -- abuse, disasters, violence -- but children may also perceive and respond to more
ordinary events as very threatening. A playground accident, the loss of a loved one, school problems, or
choking on a piece of popcorn can be a part of growing up. They can also be critical incidents that cause a
child to view him- or herself as helpless or powerless, to become fearful, and to develop debilitating
behavioral problems. In "Small Wonders: Healing Childhood Trauma with EMDR, " Joan Lovett, M.D.,
shares engaging clinical stories -- mysteries involving children who present her with puzzling and disturbing
behaviors. She imaginatively focuses her knowledge of pediatrics, play therapy, and EMDR to alleviate the
real-life ordeals of real-life children. Featuring a foreword by Francine Shapiro, "Small Wonders" is the most
comprehensive and insightful book to explore the potential of EMDR for child therapy. This enlightening
book is intended for parents who are concerned with having their children feel confident, for adults who
want ins
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From reader reviews:

Aaron Tyler:

Now a day people that Living in the era just where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not involve people to be aware of each data they get. How people have to be
smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Reading a
book can help folks out of this uncertainty Information specifically this [(Small Wonders: Healing Childhood
Trauma with Emdr)] [Author: Joan Lovett] published on (October, 2007) book as this book offers you rich
details and knowledge. Of course the info in this book hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it as you
know.

Dan Maes:

The event that you get from [(Small Wonders: Healing Childhood Trauma with Emdr)] [Author: Joan
Lovett] published on (October, 2007) may be the more deep you rooting the information that hide into the
words the more you get thinking about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to know but [(Small
Wonders: Healing Childhood Trauma with Emdr)] [Author: Joan Lovett] published on (October, 2007)
giving you enjoyment feeling of reading. The author conveys their point in selected way that can be
understood through anyone who read the item because the author of this book is well-known enough. This
particular book also makes your own vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to understand then can go with
you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We recommend you for having this particular [(Small
Wonders: Healing Childhood Trauma with Emdr)] [Author: Joan Lovett] published on (October, 2007)
instantly.

Lee Long:

This [(Small Wonders: Healing Childhood Trauma with Emdr)] [Author: Joan Lovett] published on
(October, 2007) is great book for you because the content that is certainly full of information for you who
have always deal with world and get to make decision every minute. This kind of book reveal it details
accurately using great coordinate word or we can point out no rambling sentences within it. So if you are
read the idea hurriedly you can have whole information in it. Doesn't mean it only provides you with straight
forward sentences but tough core information with lovely delivering sentences. Having [(Small Wonders:
Healing Childhood Trauma with Emdr)] [Author: Joan Lovett] published on (October, 2007) in your hand
like keeping the world in your arm, facts in it is not ridiculous one. We can say that no guide that offer you
world with ten or fifteen second right but this publication already do that. So , this is certainly good reading
book. Heya Mr. and Mrs. active do you still doubt which?

Raul Miller:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a guide we can know
everything we wish. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year had



been exactly added. This e-book [(Small Wonders: Healing Childhood Trauma with Emdr)] [Author: Joan
Lovett] published on (October, 2007) was filled regarding science. Spend your time to add your knowledge
about your scientific disciplines competence. Some people has distinct feel when they reading the book. If
you know how big benefit of a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a publication. In the modern era like
now, many ways to get book that you wanted.
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