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Between 100,000 and 200,000 women were forced into sexual slavery by the Japanese military between the
early 1930s and 1945. Yet successive post-war Japanese governments have refused to acknowledge what
took place and no reparations have been made to the mainly Korean victims. Recent developments in human
rights and women's rights in Korea have led to the surviving Comfort Women to overcome traditional taboos
of chastity, defilement and shame to speak out for the first time. This book contains 19 exclusive first-hand
testimonies from surviving Comfort Women, which portray the coercion, violence, abduction, rape and false
imprisonment they suffered at the hands of the Japanese military. The Comfort Women's stories were
originally published in Korean by the Korean Council for the Women Drafted for Military Sexual Slavery by
Japan (formed in 1990 to campaign for recognition and reparation for the surviving Comfort Women).
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From reader reviews:

Douglas Barlow:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to be aware of everything in the world. Each book has different aim or maybe goal; it means that
guide has different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. These are
reading whatever they take because their hobby will be reading a book. How about the person who don't like
examining a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book after they found difficult problem or even
exercise. Well, probably you will require this True Stories of the Korean Comfort Women: The Korean
Council for Women Drafted for Military... (Cassell Global Issues Series).

Linda Brown:

Book will be written, printed, or created for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a book.
Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important issue to bring us around the world. Alongside
that you can your reading talent was fluently. A book True Stories of the Korean Comfort Women: The
Korean Council for Women Drafted for Military... (Cassell Global Issues Series) will make you to possibly
be smarter. You can feel much more confidence if you can know about everything. But some of you think
this open or reading the book make you bored. It isn't make you fun. Why they might be thought like that?
Have you trying to find best book or suited book with you?

Lou Bryant:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to select book like
comic, quick story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not seeking True Stories of the Korean Comfort
Women: The Korean Council for Women Drafted for Military... (Cassell Global Issues Series) that give your
fun preference will be satisfied through reading this book. Reading habit all over the world can be said as the
opportunity for people to know world much better then how they react in the direction of the world. It can't
be explained constantly that reading routine only for the geeky individual but for all of you who wants to be
success person. So , for all you who want to start reading through as your good habit, it is possible to pick
True Stories of the Korean Comfort Women: The Korean Council for Women Drafted for Military... (Cassell
Global Issues Series) become your personal starter.

Coleman Bailey:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make you to
definitely understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information simpler to
share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and
soon. You will see that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. The particular book that
recommended to you personally is True Stories of the Korean Comfort Women: The Korean Council for



Women Drafted for Military... (Cassell Global Issues Series) this guide consist a lot of the information from
the condition of this world now. This book was represented how do the world has grown up. The language
styles that writer make usage of to explain it is easy to understand. The particular writer made some
investigation when he makes this book. That's why this book suited all of you.
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