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Over 100 recipes to discover new ways to work with Apache's Enterprise Search Server

Improve the way in which you work with Apache Solr to make your search engine quicker and more●

effective
Deal with performance, setup, and configuration problems in no time●

Discover little-known Solr functionalities and create your own modules to customize Solr to your●

company's needs
Part of Packt's Cookbook series; each chapter covers a different aspect of working with Solr●

In Detail

Apache Solr is a fast, scalable, modern, open source, and easy-to-use search engine. It allows you to develop
a professional search engine for your ecommerce site, web application, or back office software. Setting up
Solr is easy, but configuring it to get the most out of your site is the difficult bit.

The Solr 3.1 Cookbook will make your everyday work easier by using real-life examples that show you how
to deal with the most common problems that can arise while using the Apache Solr search engine. Why
waste your time searching the Internet for solutions when you can have all the answers in one place?

This cookbook will show you how to get the most out of your search engine. Each chapter covers a different
aspect of working with Solr from analyzing your text data through querying, performance improvement, and
developing your own modules. The practical recipes will help you to quickly solve common problems with
data analysis, show you how to use faceting to collect data and to speed up the performance of Solr. You will
learn about functionalities that most newbies are unaware of, such as sorting results by a function value,
highlighting matched words, and computing statistics to make your work with Solr easy and stress free .

This practical guide shows you how to get the most out of Apache Solr 3.1 with recipes that show you how
to improve your search engine's performance, analyze data quickly and efficiently, and customize the search
server with your own modules.

What you will learn from this book

Index data in different formats and forms●

Use the Solr administration panel to discover the most commonly searched for information●

Learn how to use different data grouping techniques●

Improve your Solr deployment performance●

Create and use your own Apache Solr modules●

Configure your cache to cater for changes in your data●

Import data using the Data Import Handler and delta query●

Query Solr to search for phrases, sort results by different fields, and search geographical points●

Create new applications that use Solr●

Reduce the size of your index for faster searching●

Approach



This book is part of Packt's Cookbook series; each chapter looks at a different aspect of working with
Apache Solr. The recipes deal with common problems of working with Solr by using easy-to-understand,
real-life examples. The book is not in any way a complete Apache Solr reference and you should see it as a
helping hand when things get rough on your journey with Apache Solr.

Who this book is written for

Developers who are working with Apache Solr and would like to know how to combat common problems
will find this book of great use. Knowledge of Apache Lucene would be a bonus but is not required.
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From reader reviews:

Shane Bodine:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always aim to and must have the free time or they will get wide
range of stress from both day to day life and work. So , once we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely of course. People is human not just a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity do you
have when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer will probably unlimited right. Then
do you try this one, reading guides. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, the book you
have read will be Apache Solr 3.1 Cookbook.

Frances Drury:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you actually, why because this Apache Solr 3.1 Cookbook book
written by well-known writer who really knows well how to make book that may be understand by anyone
who also read the book. Written in good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and publishing skill
only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still hesitation Apache Solr 3.1 Cookbook as good
book not just by the cover but also from the content. This is one guide that can break don't assess book by its
include, so do you still needing an additional sixth sense to pick this specific!? Oh come on your examining
sixth sense already told you so why you have to listening to a different sixth sense.

Jose Johnson:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information simpler to
share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and
soon. You can see that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. Often the book that
recommended for your requirements is Apache Solr 3.1 Cookbook this guide consist a lot of the information
with the condition of this world now. This particular book was represented how do the world has grown up.
The words styles that writer make usage of to explain it is easy to understand. The particular writer made
some analysis when he makes this book. Honestly, that is why this book suitable all of you.

Genia Vanderford:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book has been rare? Why so
many problem for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people likes
looking at, not only science book but in addition novel and Apache Solr 3.1 Cookbook as well as others
sources were given understanding for you. After you know how the great a book, you feel wish to read more
and more. Science reserve was created for teacher or maybe students especially. Those textbooks are helping
them to put their knowledge. In some other case, beside science publication, any other book likes Apache
Solr 3.1 Cookbook to make your spare time much more colorful. Many types of book like this one.
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