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The Routledge Handbook of Comparative Political Institutions (HCPI) is designed to serve as a
comprehensive reference guide to our accumulated knowledge and the cutting edge of scholarship about
political institutions in the comparative context. It differs from existing handbooks in that it focuses squarely
on institutions but also discusses how they intersect with the study of mass behaviour and explain important
outcomes, drawing on the perspective of comparative politics. The Handbook is organized into three
sections:

The first section, consisting of six chapters, is organized around broad theoretical and empirical challenges●

affecting the study of institutions. It highlights the major issues that emerge among scholars defining,
measuring, and analyzing institutions. 
The second section includes fifteen chapters, each of which handles a different substantive institution of●

importance in comparative politics. This section covers traditional topics, such as electoral rules and
federalism, as well as less conventional but equally important areas, including authoritarian institutions,
labor market institutions, and the military. Each chapter not only provides a summary of our current state
of knowledge on the topic, but also advances claims that emphasise the research frontier on the topic and
that should encourage greater investigation. 
The final section, encompassing seven chapters, examines the relationship between institutions and a●

variety of important outcomes, such as political violence, economic performance, and voting behavior. The
idea is to consider what features of the political, sociological, and economic world we understand better
because of the scholarly attention to institutions.

Featuring contributions from leading researchers in the field from the US, UK, Europe and elsewhere, this
Handbook will be of great interest to all students and scholars of political institutions, political behaviour and
comparative politics.

Jennifer Gandhi is Associate Professor, Department of Political Science, Emory University.

Rubén Ruiz-Rufino is Lecturer in International Politics, Department of Political Economy, King’s College
London.
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From reader reviews:

Lauren Barnett:

As people who live in often the modest era should be update about what going on or data even knowledge to
make these individuals keep up with the era that is certainly always change and move forward. Some of you
maybe will update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems
coming to an individual is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Routledge Handbook of
Comparative Political Institutions is our recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, because this
book serves what you want and need in this era.

Kathleen Bosarge:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book
and so. There are a lot of reasons why people love it. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new
information. When you read a book you will get new information since book is one of numerous ways to
share the information or perhaps their idea. Second, reading through a book will make you more imaginative.
When you reading through a book especially hype book the author will bring one to imagine the story how
the character types do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to some others. When you read this
Routledge Handbook of Comparative Political Institutions, you could tells your family, friends and also soon
about yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire average, make them reading a book.

Phyllis Smith:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book specifically book entitled
Routledge Handbook of Comparative Political Institutions the mind will drift away trough every dimension,
wandering in every aspect that maybe unfamiliar for but surely can be your mind friends. Imaging each word
written in a publication then become one application form conclusion and explanation this maybe you never
get before. The Routledge Handbook of Comparative Political Institutions giving you another experience
more than blown away your brain but also giving you useful details for your better life on this era. So now
let us explain to you the relaxing pattern is your body and mind will be pleased when you are finished
studying it, like winning an activity. Do you want to try this extraordinary wasting spare time activity?

Mattie Regan:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to opt for book like
comic, short story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not attempting Routledge Handbook of
Comparative Political Institutions that give your pleasure preference will be satisfied simply by reading this
book. Reading habit all over the world can be said as the opportunity for people to know world a great deal
better then how they react when it comes to the world. It can't be mentioned constantly that reading practice
only for the geeky man but for all of you who wants to be success person. So , for all you who want to start
looking at as your good habit, it is possible to pick Routledge Handbook of Comparative Political Institutions
become your own personal starter.
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