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Six years ago, at the end of my professional career in the oil industry, I left my management position within
Agip S.p.A., a major multinational oil company whose headquarters are in Italy, to take up the chair in
reservoir engineering at the University of Bologna, Italy. There, I decided to prepare what was initially
intended to be a set of lecture notes for the students attending the course. However, while preparing these
notes, I became so absorbed in the subject matter that I soon found myself creating a substantial volume of
text which could not only serve as a university course material, but also as a reference for wider professional
applications. Thanks to the interest shown by the then president of Agip, Ing. Giuseppe Muscarella, this did
indeed culminate in the publication of the first Italian edition of this book in 1989. The translation into
English and publication of these volumes owes much to the encouragement of the current president of Agip,
Ing. Guglielmo Moscato. My grateful thanks are due to both gentlemen. And now - the English version,
translated from the second Italian edition, and containing a number of revisions and much additional
material. As well as providing a solid theoretical basis for the various topics, this work draws extensively on
my 36 years of worldwide experience in the development and exploitation of oil and gas fields.
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From reader reviews:

Laura Wilson:

Spent a free time for you to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their spare time with their
family, or their friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, planning to beach, or
picnic inside park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something
different to fill your own personal free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book might be option to fill your
no cost time/ holiday. The first thing that you will ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If
you want to try look for book, may be the publication untitled Principles of Petroleum Reservoir
Engineering: Volume 1 can be very good book to read. May be it might be best activity to you.

Margie Sutton:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them household
or their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, or perhaps
playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity that's look different you can
read some sort of book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent 24
hours a day to reading a publication. The book Principles of Petroleum Reservoir Engineering: Volume 1 it
is quite good to read. There are a lot of folks that recommended this book. These folks were enjoying reading
this book. In case you did not have enough space bringing this book you can buy typically the e-book. You
can m0ore quickly to read this book from a smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book provides
high quality.

Edward Strode:

You will get this Principles of Petroleum Reservoir Engineering: Volume 1 by look at the bookstore or Mall.
Only viewing or reviewing it could possibly to be your solve challenge if you get difficulties for ones
knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are various. Not only by simply written or printed but additionally can you
enjoy this book simply by e-book. In the modern era such as now, you just looking by your local mobile
phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your ways to get more information about your
book. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still revise. Let's try to
choose correct ways for you.

Mary Moore:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library or to
make summary for some book, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's internal or real
their passion. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to there but
nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring in addition to can't see
colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important to suit your needs. As we
know that on this time, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, many ways to reach



Chinese's country. So , this Principles of Petroleum Reservoir Engineering: Volume 1 can make you feel
more interested to read.
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