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Why do so many Americans drive for miles each autumn to buy a vegetable that they are unlikely to eat?
While most people around the world eat pumpkin throughout the year, North Americans reserve it for
holiday pies and other desserts that celebrate the harvest season and the rural past. They decorate their
houses with pumpkins every autumn and welcome Halloween trick-or-treaters with elaborately carved jack-
o'-lanterns. Towns hold annual pumpkin festivals featuring giant pumpkins and carving contests, even
though few have any historic ties to the crop.

In this fascinating cultural and natural history, Cindy Ott tells the story of the pumpkin. Beginning with the
myth of the first Thanksgiving, she shows how Americans have used the pumpkin to fulfull their desire to
maintain connections to nature and to the family farm of lore, and, ironically, how small farms and rural
communities have been revitalized in the process. And while the pumpkin has inspired American myths and
traditions, the pumpkin itself has changed because of the ways people have perceived, valued, and used it.
Pumpkin is a smart and lively study of the deep meanings hidden in common things and their power to make
profound changes in the world around us.
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From reader reviews:

Leslie Bennett:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Yeah, you
can choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time
to take a wander, shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or read a book titled Pumpkin: The
Curious History of an American Icon (Weyerhaeuser Environmental Books)? Maybe it is to be best activity
for you. You realize beside you can spend your time along with your favorite's book, you can wiser than
before. Do you agree with their opinion or you have some other opinion?

Tammy Schuler:

As people who live in often the modest era should be up-date about what going on or data even knowledge to
make them keep up with the era that is certainly always change and move forward. Some of you maybe will
update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems coming to you is you
don't know what one you should start with. This Pumpkin: The Curious History of an American Icon
(Weyerhaeuser Environmental Books) is our recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, as this
book serves what you want and want in this era.

Rosemary Lilly:

The guide untitled Pumpkin: The Curious History of an American Icon (Weyerhaeuser Environmental
Books) is the book that recommended to you to study. You can see the quality of the e-book content that will
be shown to a person. The language that publisher use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The
writer was did a lot of investigation when write the book, therefore the information that they share to you is
absolutely accurate. You also could get the e-book of Pumpkin: The Curious History of an American Icon
(Weyerhaeuser Environmental Books) from the publisher to make you considerably more enjoy free time.

Betty Dunham:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make
anyone to understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information quicker to
share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and soon. You
can see that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. The particular book that
recommended to you personally is Pumpkin: The Curious History of an American Icon (Weyerhaeuser
Environmental Books) this e-book consist a lot of the information on the condition of this world now. This
book was represented just how can the world has grown up. The dialect styles that writer make usage of to
explain it is easy to understand. The writer made some study when he makes this book. That's why this book
acceptable all of you.
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