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Planning.  Implementing.  Assessing.  The act of teaching is founded on these three principles.  It is the
process of doing these three things well that makes for good teaching.  The goal of this book is to provide the
tools that will enable preservice and inservice teachers to plan, implement, and assess effectively in this era
of standards and accountability. 
 
This general methods text covers teaching in a practical fashion, while providing complete and concise
coverage.   The book is organized into four units.  Each chapter is organized with the following pedagogical
features: an introduction, learning objectives, an Applying in the Classroom case study and questions, a
Reflecting On feature (which ties the content of the chapter to the INTASC standards,) a summary,
Preparing for Your Licensure Examination feature, Video Classroom Exercise, Developing Your Portfolio,
Questions for Discussion, Suggestions for Field Experience, and Tools for Teaching, and key concepts. 
 
The text is designed to be interactive.  It emphasizes case studies and real-life classroom scenarios.  This
book provides students with the resources they need to master the material and become not just competent,
but a good and effective teacher.
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From reader reviews:

Doris Simmons:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be upgrade about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these keep up with the era that is always change and make progress. Some of you maybe
will update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems coming to
anyone is you don't know which you should start with. This Methods for Teaching: Promoting Student
Learning in K-12 Classrooms (with MyEducationLab) (8th Edition) is our recommendation to make you
keep up with the world. Why, because book serves what you want and need in this era.

Joann Hamilton:

Reading a book to get new life style in this year; every people loves to examine a book. When you learn a
book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge, simply
because book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what forms of
book that you have read. If you would like get information about your study, you can read education books,
but if you act like you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, such us novel, comics, and soon. The
Methods for Teaching: Promoting Student Learning in K-12 Classrooms (with MyEducationLab) (8th
Edition) offer you a new experience in reading a book.

Nettie Powers:

In this era which is the greater person or who has ability to do something more are more important than
other. Do you want to become one of it? It is just simple solution to have that. What you have to do is just
spending your time very little but quite enough to have a look at some books. One of several books in the top
listing in your reading list is Methods for Teaching: Promoting Student Learning in K-12 Classrooms (with
MyEducationLab) (8th Edition). This book which is qualified as The Hungry Hills can get you closer in
turning into precious person. By looking right up and review this reserve you can get many advantages.

Paula Salas:

A lot of publication has printed but it differs. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the
most beneficial book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is known as of
book Methods for Teaching: Promoting Student Learning in K-12 Classrooms (with MyEducationLab) (8th
Edition). You can include your knowledge by it. Without leaving the printed book, it could add your
knowledge and make you actually happier to read. It is most significant that, you must aware about guide. It
can bring you from one place to other place.
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