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edition. Excerpt: ... tract. He has three children living. Lyman J. Clark, born in 1828, in Erie county, N. Y..
was married in 1853 to Miss Eliza Fuller, daughter of Elijah and Martha Fuller, of Castile. She died in 1864,
and in 1867 he married Miss H. Minerva Belden, daughter of Paul and Miranda Belden, of Castile. He has
two children. He is a farmer, and by trade a wagon maker. He came to Castile in 1836. John B. Clark, son of
Jacob and Nancy Clark, was bom in 1826 in Castile, where be has since resided. He was married in 1851 to
Miss Margaret Kennedy, who died in 1839. In 1873 he married Miss Elizabeth O'Hara, of Cayuga county, N.
Y. He is a farmer. Jonas Clark, farmer, son of Jacob and Nancy Clark, was born in 1839 in Castile, and was
married in 1861 to Miss Roxana Utter, daughter of Sylvester u:id Betsey Utter, of Castile. He has five
children. His father, Jacob Clark, unlisted in the war of 1812, at the age of seventeen years, and received a
pension. Dow I. Clute was born in Schenectady in 1813, and was marriod in 1841 to Miss Sarah B. Sayles,
of Castile. They had one child. Mrs. Clute died in H54, and Mr. Clute married in 1861 Miss Mary Jane
Eveland, of Castile. He came to Castile in 1818 with his parents, Dow I. Clute and Ann Clute, who had
thirteen children. His father served in the war of 1812, and died at Castile in 1864, aged one hundred years
and three months. Lyman S. Coleman was born August 30th, 1840, in West Haven, Vt.. and was married to
Miss Lucy A. Bliss, of Genosee Falls, N. Y., December 10th, 1830. He came to Castile Station in October,
1860. He and his partner. Orange Taber, are produoe dealers. Mr. C. has held various positions of honor and
trust in his town and in the State Legislature. John W. Cook, son of P. L. and Hannah...
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From reader reviews:

Patricia Stewart:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Guide is very important thing for
us to learn everything in the world. Each guide has different aim or maybe goal; it means that publication has
different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. These are
reading whatever they get because their hobby is actually reading a book. Think about the person who don't
like reading a book? Sometime, person feel need book after they found difficult problem or maybe exercise.
Well, probably you should have this History of Wyoming County, N.Y; With Illustrations, Biographical
Sketches, and Portraits of Some Pioneers and Prominent Residents.

Helen Johnson:

What do you concerning book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you really need
something to explain what you problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy particular person? If
you don't have spare time to complete others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And
you have spare time? What did you do? Everybody has many questions above. They need to answer that
question since just their can do that. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is
correct. Because start from on kindergarten until university need this kind of History of Wyoming County,
N.Y; With Illustrations, Biographical Sketches, and Portraits of Some Pioneers and Prominent Residents to
read.

Sean Lee:

Precisely why? Because this History of Wyoming County, N.Y; With Illustrations, Biographical Sketches,
and Portraits of Some Pioneers and Prominent Residents is an unordinary book that the inside of the reserve
waiting for you to snap it but latter it will surprise you with the secret that inside. Reading this book adjacent
to it was fantastic author who else write the book in such wonderful way makes the content within easier to
understand, entertaining way but still convey the meaning completely. So , it is good for you for not
hesitating having this any more or you going to regret it. This amazing book will give you a lot of gains than
the other book include such as help improving your skill and your critical thinking technique. So , still want
to hesitate having that book? If I were being you I will go to the e-book store hurriedly.

Dixie Santiago:

Some individuals said that they feel fed up when they reading a guide. They are directly felt the item when
they get a half portions of the book. You can choose the book History of Wyoming County, N.Y; With
Illustrations, Biographical Sketches, and Portraits of Some Pioneers and Prominent Residents to make your
own personal reading is interesting. Your skill of reading talent is developing when you including reading.
Try to choose simple book to make you enjoy to study it and mingle the opinion about book and examining
especially. It is to be initially opinion for you to like to start a book and study it. Beside that the reserve



History of Wyoming County, N.Y; With Illustrations, Biographical Sketches, and Portraits of Some Pioneers
and Prominent Residents can to be your brand new friend when you're really feel alone and confuse using
what must you're doing of their time.
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