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Azadeh Moaveni, longtime Middle East correspondent for Time magazine, returns to Iran to cover the rise of
President Mahmoud Ahmadinejad. Living and working in Tehran, she finds a nation that openly yearns for
freedom and contact with the West but whose economic grievances and nationalist spirit find an outlet in
Ahmadinejad’s strident pronouncements. And then the unexpected happens: Azadeh falls in love with a
young Iranian man and decides to get married and start a family in Tehran. Suddenly, she finds herself
navigating an altogether different side of Iranian life. As women are arrested for “immodest dress” and the
authorities unleash a campaign of intimidation against journalists, Azadeh is forced to make the hard
decision that her family’s future lies outside Iran. Powerful and poignant, Honeymoon in Tehran is the
harrowing story of a young woman’s tenuous life in a country she thought she could change.
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From reader reviews:

Paul McKinney:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important take action, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add your
knowledge by the reserve entitled Honeymoon in Tehran: Two Years of Love and Danger in Iran. Try to
make book Honeymoon in Tehran: Two Years of Love and Danger in Iran as your buddy. It means that it
can to become your friend when you sense alone and beside regarding course make you smarter than in the
past. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you personally. The book makes you a lot more confidence because you
can know every little thing by the book. So , let's make new experience and knowledge with this book.

Timothy Brown:

Throughout other case, little men and women like to read book Honeymoon in Tehran: Two Years of Love
and Danger in Iran. You can choose the best book if you love reading a book. So long as we know about how
is important any book Honeymoon in Tehran: Two Years of Love and Danger in Iran. You can add expertise
and of course you can around the world with a book. Absolutely right, simply because from book you can
understand everything! From your country till foreign or abroad you may be known. About simple matter
until wonderful thing you may know that. In this era, we could open a book or searching by internet device.
It is called e-book. You can use it when you feel bored stiff to go to the library. Let's go through.

Dave Edwards:

The experience that you get from Honeymoon in Tehran: Two Years of Love and Danger in Iran is the more
deep you searching the information that hide into the words the more you get interested in reading it. It does
not mean that this book is hard to comprehend but Honeymoon in Tehran: Two Years of Love and Danger in
Iran giving you thrill feeling of reading. The article author conveys their point in selected way that can be
understood by simply anyone who read the item because the author of this e-book is well-known enough.
This kind of book also makes your own vocabulary increase well. That makes it easy to understand then can
go along, both in printed or e-book style are available. We highly recommend you for having this particular
Honeymoon in Tehran: Two Years of Love and Danger in Iran instantly.

Mary Killgore:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside with friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by studying a book. Ugh, ya
think reading a book can actually hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It okay you can have
the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Honeymoon in Tehran: Two Years of
Love and Danger in Iran which is getting the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's observe.
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