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See how and why Washington is not functioning.

Bob Woodward’s freshly reported, thirty-five-page Afterword to his national bestseller, The Price of
Politics, provides a detailed, often verbatim account of what happened in the dramatic “fiscal cliff” face-off
at the end of 2012 between President Obama and the Republicans.

Now it’s happening again. In fall 2013, Washington faces a new round of budget and fiscal wars that could
derail the American and global economies.

“We are primarily a blocking majority,” said Michael Sommers, Speaker John Boehner’s chief of staff,
summarizing the House Republican position.

It was the land of no-compromise:

On health care cuts over ten years, Boehner suggested to Obama, you are $400 billion, I’m at $600 billion.
“Can we split the difference here? Can we land at $500 billion?”

“Four hundred billion is it,” Obama replied. “I just can’t see how we go any further on that.”

After making $120 billion in other concessions, Obama pleaded with Boehner, “What is it about the
politics?”
“My guys just aren’t there,” Boehner replied.
“We are $150 billion off, man. I don’t get it. There’s something I don’t get.”

The Price of Politics chronicles the inside story of how President Obama and the U.S. Congress tried, and
failed, to restore the American economy and set it on a course to fiscal stability. Woodward pierces the
secretive world of Washington policymaking once again, with a close-up story crafted from meeting notes,
documents, working papers, and interviews with key players, including President Obama and House Speaker
John Boehner. Woodward lays bare the broken relationship between President Obama and the Congress.
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From reader reviews:

Jessica Jackson:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also get a life style. This reading habit give you lot
of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside the book
which improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of publication
you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you want feel
happy read one with theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. The particular The Price of Politics
is kind of book which is giving the reader capricious experience.

Joan Freeman:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a book will give you a lot of new
information. When you read a book you will get new information mainly because book is one of numerous
ways to share the information or even their idea. Second, studying a book will make you more imaginative.
When you studying a book especially fictional works book the author will bring you to imagine the story
how the people do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to other people. When you read
this The Price of Politics, it is possible to tells your family, friends as well as soon about yours guide. Your
knowledge can inspire the others, make them reading a e-book.

Ruth Little:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information quicker
to share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and soon. You
will observe that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. The particular book that
recommended to you is The Price of Politics this e-book consist a lot of the information on the condition of
this world now. That book was represented how does the world has grown up. The language styles that
writer use for explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some research when he makes this
book. Honestly, that is why this book acceptable all of you.

Christopher Dixon:

A lot of reserve has printed but it differs. You can get it by net on social media. You can choose the best
book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is called of book The Price of
Politics. You can include your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the printed book, it can add your
knowledge and make a person happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about guide. It can
bring you from one destination to other place.
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