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An expose of the /worst act of treason in our history -- the betrayal of American POWs Following World
War 11, Korea and Vietnam. The Senate Committee on Foreign Relations issued An Examination of U.S.
Policy Toward POWs/MIAs on May 23, 1991. It declared: "World War II was a great military victory for the
United States. Despite the total victory in Europe thousands of U.S. soldiers, perhaps as many as 20,000
were never repatriated from Russian prisoner of war camps, prisons and forced labor concentration camps."
At least 10,000 American POW/MIAs were known to be held by the North Korean savages after the Korean
War ended.. They were shamelessly abandoned. We may never know how many American military men
were deliberately left behind in Communist Occupied North Korea by the traitorous elected and unelected
officials who run the U.S. government! Researcher Cynthia V. Ward charged in August of 1986 . "The
evidence grows stronger and stronger that hundreds of Americans are still alive in Communist captivity in
Vietnam. And, according to many who have studied this matter most closely, our government knows their
location and in some instances their names." There were only 591 POWs repatriated under the auspices of
Operation Homecoming during February and March of 1973. The 591 figure represented a miniscule 12
percent of the figure of 5,000 POWs held by the North Vietnamese.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Jackson:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing for us to
learn everything in the world. Each book has different aim as well as goal; it means that book has different
type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They are reading whatever
they consider because their hobby is definitely reading a book. How about the person who don't like
examining a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book when they found difficult problem as well as
exercise. Well, probably you will require this Unwanted Dead or Alive!: An Expose of the Worst Act of
Treason In Our History -- The Betrayal of Ameriican POWs Following World War 11, Korea and Vietnam.

Ernest Baker:

The book Unwanted Dead or Alive!: An Expose of the Worst Act of Treason In Our History -- The Betrayal
of Ameriican POWs Following World War 11, Korea and Vietnam can give more knowledge and also the
precise product information about everything you want. So why must we leave the great thing like a book
Unwanted Dead or Alive!: An Expose of the Worst Act of Treason In Our History -- The Betrayal of
Ameriican POWs Following World War 11, Korea and Vietnam? A number of you have a different opinion
about reserve. But one aim in which book can give many details for us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try
to closer together with your book. Knowledge or facts that you take for that, it is possible to give for each
other; you can share all of these. Book Unwanted Dead or Alive!: An Expose of the Worst Act of Treason In
Our History -- The Betrayal of Ameriican POWs Following World War 11, Korea and Vietnam has simple
shape however, you know: it has great and large function for you. You can search the enormous world by
available and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Muriel Carpenter:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information currently can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a expertise or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider any time those information which is inside the former life are difficult to be find than now could be
taking seriously which one is appropriate to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If
you have the unstable resource then you have it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for
you. All of those possibilities will not happen inside you if you take Unwanted Dead or Alive!: An Expose of
the Worst Act of Treason In Our History -- The Betrayal of Ameriican POWs Following World War 11,
Korea and Vietnam as your daily resource information.

Edward Chavez:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book when



compared with can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because all this time you only find guide that
need more time to be read. Unwanted Dead or Alive!: An Expose of the Worst Act of Treason In Our
History -- The Betrayal of Ameriican POWs Following World War 11, Korea and Vietnam can be your
answer as it can be read by a person who have those short time problems.
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