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Sexy, hedonistic, hilarious - Ann Summers parties are the ultimate girls' night in. Promising the perfect
antidote to the toils of everyday life - sexual pleasure - they are the 'naughty but nice' version of the classic
Tupperware® party.

Ann Summers parties are incredibly popular, with around 4000 parties held in Britain every week. The basis
is simple: to provide an all-female environment where women can buy sexy lingerie, erotic fashion, sex toys
and other sex-related products. In many respects these parties enable women to transgress social taboos in
the comfort of their own homes. But they are also a subtle means of constructing and enforcing heterosexual
femininity.

This book investigates what really goes on at these 'special' homosocial gatherings, where heterosexual
women drink, laugh, shop, play party games and talk about sex. Storr develops a new analysis of the ways
heterosexual women identify with and against each other - and of what this tells us about gender, sexuality
and consumption in contemporary society. Drawing on both participant observation and in-depth interviews
with party organizers, this fascinating and fun book is an indispensable guide to the politics of 'post-feminist'
culture.
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From reader reviews:

Kathleen Owens:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yes, you
can choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent their very own spare time to
take a go walking, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or maybe read a book entitled
Latex and Lingerie: Shopping for Pleasure at Ann Summers Parties (Materializing Culture)? Maybe it is
being best activity for you. You realize beside you can spend your time with the favorite's book, you can
wiser than before. Do you agree with their opinion or you have various other opinion?

Gregory Sims:

Book is usually written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
guide. Book has a different type. As we know that book is important point to bring us around the world.
Beside that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A guide Latex and Lingerie: Shopping for Pleasure
at Ann Summers Parties (Materializing Culture) will make you to become smarter. You can feel more
confidence if you can know about every thing. But some of you think in which open or reading a book make
you bored. It's not make you fun. Why they can be thought like that? Have you looking for best book or
acceptable book with you?

Arthur Daniel:

The book Latex and Lingerie: Shopping for Pleasure at Ann Summers Parties (Materializing Culture) can
give more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want. So why must we
leave the best thing like a book Latex and Lingerie: Shopping for Pleasure at Ann Summers Parties
(Materializing Culture)? Wide variety you have a different opinion about guide. But one aim in which book
can give many info for us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try to closer with your book. Knowledge or facts
that you take for that, you may give for each other; it is possible to share all of these. Book Latex and
Lingerie: Shopping for Pleasure at Ann Summers Parties (Materializing Culture) has simple shape however
you know: it has great and massive function for you. You can search the enormous world by open up and
read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Donald Labelle:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of
new data. When you read a book you will get new information simply because book is one of several ways to
share the information as well as their idea. Second, reading through a book will make an individual more
imaginative. When you reading a book especially fictional works book the author will bring one to imagine
the story how the characters do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to some others.
When you read this Latex and Lingerie: Shopping for Pleasure at Ann Summers Parties (Materializing



Culture), you may tells your family, friends and soon about yours book. Your knowledge can inspire
average, make them reading a book.
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