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A significant step forward in the world of earth observation was made with the development of imaging
spectrometry. Imaging spectrometers measure reflected solar radiance from the earth in many narrow
spectral bands. Such a spectroscopical imaging system is capable of detecting subtle absorption bands in the
reflectance spectra and measure the reflectance spectra of various objects with a very high accuracy. As a
result, imaging spectrometry enables a better identification of objects at the earth surface and a better
quantification of the object properties than can be achieved by traditional earth observation sensors such as
Landsat TM and SPOT. The various chapters in the book present the concepts of imaging spectrometry by
discussing the underlying physics and the analytical image processing techniques. The second part of the
book presents in detail a wide variety of applications of these new techniques ranging from mineral
identification, mapping of expansive soils, land degradation, agricultural crops, natural vegetation and
surface water quality.

Additional information on extras.springer.com
Sample hyperspectral remote sensing data sets and ENVI viewing software (Freelook) are available on
http://extras.springer.com
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From reader reviews:

Cleveland Bolton:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yep, you
can choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time
to take a walk, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or read a book eligible Imaging
Spectrometry: Basic Principles and Prospective Applications (Remote Sensing and Digital Image
Processing)? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You realize beside you can spend your time with your
favorite's book, you can more intelligent than before. Do you agree with it has the opinion or you have other
opinion?

William Carroll:

Reading a book tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With examining you can get a lot of
information that could give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world can share their idea.
Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their very own reader with their story
or even their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the publications. But also they write about the
information about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
your children, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors on earth always try to
improve their ability in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write for their book. One of
them is this Imaging Spectrometry: Basic Principles and Prospective Applications (Remote Sensing and
Digital Image Processing).

Jeffrey Blough:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them household
or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, as well as playing
video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity this is look different you can read a new
book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent all day every day to
reading a e-book. The book Imaging Spectrometry: Basic Principles and Prospective Applications (Remote
Sensing and Digital Image Processing) it is extremely good to read. There are a lot of people that
recommended this book. We were holding enjoying reading this book. In the event you did not have enough
space to develop this book you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book
through your smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book provides high quality.

Violet Iverson:

This Imaging Spectrometry: Basic Principles and Prospective Applications (Remote Sensing and Digital
Image Processing) is brand-new way for you who has intense curiosity to look for some information because
it relief your hunger details. Getting deeper you into it getting knowledge more you know or perhaps you
who still having little bit of digest in reading this Imaging Spectrometry: Basic Principles and Prospective



Applications (Remote Sensing and Digital Image Processing) can be the light food for you personally
because the information inside that book is easy to get by anyone. These books build itself in the form which
can be reachable by anyone, that's why I mean in the e-book web form. People who think that in publication
form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this guide is the answer. So there is absolutely no in reading a
publication especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for anyone. So ,
don't miss the item! Just read this e-book kind for your better life and knowledge.
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