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Keith Otterbein, a long-time authority on anthropological studies of warfare, provides a rich synthesis of
theory, literature, and findings developed by anthropologists and scholars from other disciplines. This in-
depth--yet concise--look at warfare opens with two well-known ethnographic examples of warring peoples:
the Dani and the Yanomamö. The origins and evolution of war, types of warfare, weapons and tactics,
military organizations, and the social bases of war structure discussions within the text. Analyses of
historical events and case studies inform readers of different perspectives about why people go to war, how
societies can be identified as having war, the elements necessary for war, and how war might be avoided.
Otterbein concludes the text by presenting the concept of "Positive Peace"--promoting peace as a goal of
human existence--as a way for humans to eliminate the fatal consequences of war.

Titles of related interest also from Waveland Press: Bracey, Exploring Law and Culture (ISBN
9781577664116); Holmes-Gan, Nonviolence in Theory and Practice, Third Edition (ISBN 9781577667605);
and Pardue, Ruminations on Violence (ISBN 9781577665083).
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From reader reviews:

Molly Edwards:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing for
us to find out everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim or goal; it means that guide has
different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. They are really reading
whatever they acquire because their hobby is actually reading a book. Think about the person who don't like
reading a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book whenever they found difficult problem as well as
exercise. Well, probably you will want this The Anthropology of War.

Princess Bequette:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Yes, you can
choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to take a
wander, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or maybe read a book eligible The
Anthropology of War? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You recognize beside you can spend your
time with the favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree with it is opinion or you have various
other opinion?

Willie Letchworth:

Reading a book to become new life style in this season; every people loves to read a book. When you study a
book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge, since book has a
lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what types of book that you have read.
If you wish to get information about your study, you can read education books, but if you want to entertain
yourself you can read a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, in addition to soon. The The
Anthropology of War will give you a new experience in reading a book.

Leroy Moore:

Reserve is one of source of know-how. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students but native or
citizen want book to know the up-date information of year to year. As we know those ebooks have many
advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the world. With the book The
Anthropology of War we can take more advantage. Don't you to definitely be creative people? To become
creative person must want to read a book. Just simply choose the best book that suited with your aim. Don't
be doubt to change your life with this book The Anthropology of War. You can more inviting than now.
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