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Steve Berry returns with his latest thriller, a Cotton Malone adventure involving a flaw in the United
States Constitution, a mystery about Abraham Lincoln, and a political issue that’s as explosive as it is
timely—not only in Malone’s world, but in ours.
 
September 1861: All is not as it seems. With these cryptic words, a shocking secret passed down from
president to president comes to rest in the hands of Abraham Lincoln. And as the first bloody clashes of the
Civil War unfold, Lincoln alone must decide how best to use this volatile knowledge: save thousands of
American lives, or keep the young nation from being torn apart forever?
 
The present: In Utah, the fabled remains of Mormon pioneers whose nineteenth-century expedition across
the desert met with a murderous end have been uncovered. In Washington, D.C., the official investigation of
an international entrepreneur, an elder in the Mormon church, has sparked a political battle between the
White House and a powerful United States senator. In Denmark, a Justice Department agent, missing in
action, has fallen into the hands of a dangerous zealot—a man driven by divine visions to make a prophet’s
words reality. And in a matter of a few short hours, Cotton Malone has gone from quietly selling books at his
shop in Denmark to dodging bullets in a high-speed boat chase.
 
All it takes is a phone call from his former boss in Washington, and suddenly the ex-agent is racing to rescue
an informant carrying critical intelligence. It’s just the kind of perilous business that Malone has been trying
to leave behind, ever since he retired from the Justice Department. But once he draws enemy blood, Malone
is plunged into a deadly conflict—a constitutional war secretly set in motion more than two hundred years
ago by America’s Founding Fathers.
 
From the streets of Copenhagen to the catacombs of Salzburg to the rugged mountains of Utah, the grim
specter of the Civil War looms as a dangerous conspiracy gathers power. Malone risks life, liberty, and his
greatest love in a race for the truth about Abraham Lincoln—while the fate of the United States of America
hangs in the balance.

Praise for Steve Berry and his Cotton Malone series
 
“In Malone, [Steve] Berry has created a classic, complex hero.”—USA Today
 
“Malone, a hero with a personal stake in the proceedings, is a welcome respite from the cold, calculating
superspies who litter the genre.”—Entertainment Weekly
 
“Steve Berry gets better and better with each new book.”—The Huffington Post
 
“Savvy readers . . . cannot go wrong with Cotton Malone.”—Library Journal
 
“Berry raises this genre’s stakes.”—The New York Times
 



“I love this guy.”—#1 New York Times bestselling author Lee Child

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Nancy Smith:

Here thing why this kind of The Lincoln Myth: A Novel (Cotton Malone) are different and dependable to be
yours. First of all reading through a book is good nonetheless it depends in the content of computer which is
the content is as scrumptious as food or not. The Lincoln Myth: A Novel (Cotton Malone) giving you
information deeper and in different ways, you can find any book out there but there is no book that similar
with The Lincoln Myth: A Novel (Cotton Malone). It gives you thrill reading through journey, its open up
your personal eyes about the thing this happened in the world which is might be can be happened around
you. You can bring everywhere like in area, café, or even in your technique home by train. Should you be
having difficulties in bringing the imprinted book maybe the form of The Lincoln Myth: A Novel (Cotton
Malone) in e-book can be your choice.

Mark Spears:

Reading a book to get new life style in this season; every people loves to examine a book. When you
examine a book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your
knowledge, due to the fact book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on
what types of book that you have read. If you need to get information about your examine, you can read
education books, but if you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, these us novel, comics,
along with soon. The The Lincoln Myth: A Novel (Cotton Malone) will give you new experience in reading
through a book.

Daniel Starnes:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make
anyone to understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information better to
share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon. You will
see that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. The particular book that recommended
for your requirements is The Lincoln Myth: A Novel (Cotton Malone) this reserve consist a lot of the
information in the condition of this world now. This book was represented so why is the world has grown up.
The language styles that writer value to explain it is easy to understand. The writer made some investigation
when he makes this book. That's why this book acceptable all of you.

Joseph Langley:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This kind of book The Lincoln Myth: A Novel (Cotton Malone)
was bright colored and of course has pictures around. As we know that book The Lincoln Myth: A Novel
(Cotton Malone) has many kinds or category. Start from kids until teenagers. For example Naruto or
Detective Conan you can read and believe that you are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book
are make you bored, any it can make you feel happy, fun and unwind. Try to choose the best book for you
and try to like reading in which.
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