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Nearly a half century after the civil rights movement, racial inequality remains a defining feature of
American life. Along a wide range of social and economic dimensions, African Americans consistently lag
behind whites. This troubling divide has persisted even as many of the obvious barriers to equality, such as
state-sanctioned segregation and overt racial hostility, have markedly declined. How then can we explain the
stubborn persistence of racial inequality? In Beyond Discrimination: Racial Inequality in a Post-Racist Era,
a diverse group of scholars provides a more precise understanding of when and how racial inequality can
occur without its most common antecedents, prejudice and discrimination.

Beyond Discrimination focuses on the often hidden political, economic and historical mechanisms that now
sustain the black-white divide in America. The first set of chapters examines the historical legacies that have
shaped contemporary race relations. Desmond King reviews the civil rights movement to pinpoint why racial
inequality became an especially salient issue in American politics. He argues that while the civil rights
protests led the federal government to enforce certain political rights, such as the right to vote, addressing
racial inequities in housing, education, and income never became a national priority. The volume then
considers the impact of racial attitudes in American society and institutions. Phillip Goff outlines promising
new collaborations between police departments and social scientists that will improve the measurement of
racial bias in policing. The book finally focuses on the structural processes that perpetuate racial inequality.
Devin Fergus discusses an obscure set of tax and insurance policies that, without being overtly racially
drawn, penalizes residents of minority neighborhoods and imposes an economic handicap on poor blacks and
Latinos. Naa Oyo Kwate shows how apparently neutral and apolitical market forces concentrate fast food
and alcohol advertising in minority urban neighborhoods to the detriment of the health of the community.

As it addresses the most pressing arenas of racial inequality, from education and employment to criminal
justice and health, Beyond Discrimination exposes the unequal consequences of the ordinary workings of
American society. It offers promising pathways for future research on the growing complexity of race
relations in the United States.
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From reader reviews:

Shannon Batiste:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive today, people have do
something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and notice by means
of surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated it for a while is reading. Sure,
by reading a book your ability to survive increase then having chance to endure than other is high. To suit
your needs who want to start reading a new book, we give you this Beyond Discrimination  : Racial
Inequality in a Post-Racist Era book as beginner and daily reading reserve. Why, because this book is more
than just a book.

Robert Zamora:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information presently can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a information or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider any time those information which is inside the former life are hard to be find than now's taking
seriously which one would work to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you receive
the unstable resource then you obtain it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you.
All those possibilities will not happen within you if you take Beyond Discrimination  : Racial Inequality in a
Post-Racist Era as the daily resource information.

Ronny Baird:

You could spend your free time you just read this book this reserve. This Beyond Discrimination  : Racial
Inequality in a Post-Racist Era is simple to deliver you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train
and soon. If you did not have got much space to bring the printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is make
you simpler to read it. You can save the particular book in your smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of
benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Donald Edmond:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our information for everything. By a book we can know
everything we wish. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every year was
exactly added. This publication Beyond Discrimination  : Racial Inequality in a Post-Racist Era was filled
concerning science. Spend your spare time to add your knowledge about your research competence. Some
people has diverse feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big benefit from a book, you
can feel enjoy to read a guide. In the modern era like today, many ways to get book that you just wanted.
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