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Summary

The protagonist is Tom, a young chimney sweep, who falls into a river after encountering an upper-class girl
named Ellie and being chased out of her house. There he drowns and is transformed into a "water baby", as
he is told by a caddisfly—an insect that sheds its skin—and begins his moral education. The story is
thematically concerned with Christian redemption, though Kingsley also uses the book to argue that England
treats its poor badly, and to question child labour, among other themes.

Tom embarks on a series of adventures and lessons, and enjoys the community of other water babies once he
proves himself a moral creature. The major spiritual leaders in his new world are the fairies Mrs.
Doasyouwouldbedoneby (a reference to the Golden Rule), Mrs. Bedonebyasyoudid, and Mother Carey.
Weekly, Tom is allowed the company of Ellie, who did not drown after he did.

Grimes, his old master, drowns as well, and in his final adventure, Tom travels to the end of the world to
attempt to help the man where he is being punished for his misdeeds. Tom helps Grimes to find repentance,
and Grimes will be given a second chance if he can successfully perform a final penance. By proving his
willingness to do things he does not like, if they are the right things to do, Tom earns himself a return to
human form, and becomes "a great man of science" who "can plan railways, and steam-engines, and electric
telegraphs, and rifled guns, and so forth". He and Ellie are united, although the book states that they never
marry.
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From reader reviews:

Wesley McFarland:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a understanding or any news even a concern. What people must be
consider while those information which is inside former life are difficult to be find than now's taking
seriously which one is appropriate to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you have the
unstable resource then you understand it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you.
All those possibilities will not happen in you if you take The Water Babies: A Fairy Tale for a Land Baby as
your daily resource information.

Margarito Rone:

Typically the book The Water Babies: A Fairy Tale for a Land Baby will bring one to the new experience of
reading a new book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. When you try to find new book you
just read, this book very appropriate to you. The book The Water Babies: A Fairy Tale for a Land Baby is
much recommended to you to learn. You can also get the e-book from the official web site, so you can more
easily to read the book.

Catherine Hudson:

The e-book with title The Water Babies: A Fairy Tale for a Land Baby has lot of information that you can
learn it. You can get a lot of profit after read this book. This particular book exist new expertise the
information that exist in this e-book represented the condition of the world now. That is important to yo7u to
be aware of how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you with new era of the
glowbal growth. You can read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you
want.

Brandy Anderson:

That guide can make you to feel relax. This particular book The Water Babies: A Fairy Tale for a Land Baby
was multi-colored and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book The Water Babies: A Fairy
Tale for a Land Baby has many kinds or variety. Start from kids until young adults. For example Naruto or
Detective Conan you can read and believe you are the character on there. So , not at all of book tend to be
make you bored, any it makes you feel happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the best book for you and try to
like reading that.
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