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WARNING: This is not the actual book The Valley of Amazement by Amy Tan. Do not buy this Review if
you are looking for a full copy of this great book. Read this literary review of The Valley of Amazement to
find out how critics and other readers received Amy Tan's latest novel. In Amy Tan's The Valley of
Amazement, Violet is familiar with the life of a courtesan, as her mother runs a popular house in Shanghai.
Surrounded by the British-American settlement, Violet is surprised to learn that she is half Chinese. After
being kidnapped at the age of 14 and forced to work at another courtesan house, the protagonist continuously
struggles with her identity and role as a woman in pre-communist China. The tumultuous culture of early
20th-century Shanghai adds to the conflict going on in Violet's life. Amy Tan's thorough research shines
through as she depicts the sex trade and culture within Shanghai's International Settlement. The portrayal of
the relationship between Violet and her mother creates a highly relatable protagonist. The Valley of
Amazement is geared more toward adults due to its graphic scenes of sexual content and violence. Readers
gain insight into familial relationships, different cultures, and the strength and survival of women. Witness
Violet transform as she struggles with her personal identity while immersed in a world of cultural turmoil in
The Valley of Amazement.
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From reader reviews:

Angela Drew:

Book is written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can learn everything you want by a publication.
Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important point to bring us around the world.
Adjacent to that you can your reading ability was fluently. A guide Book Review: The Valley of Amazement
will make you to become smarter. You can feel more confidence if you can know about everything. But
some of you think this open or reading some sort of book make you bored. It is not make you fun. Why they
might be thought like that? Have you in search of best book or suited book with you?

Mandy Conway:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them family or
their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, or even playing
video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity that's look different you can read some sort of
book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent 24 hours a day to reading a
book. The book Book Review: The Valley of Amazement it doesn't matter what good to read. There are a lot
of people who recommended this book. They were enjoying reading this book. Should you did not have
enough space to develop this book you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore easily to read this book out
of your smart phone. The price is not very costly but this book features high quality.

Ilene Venne:

A lot of book has printed but it is unique. You can get it by internet on social media. You can choose the
most beneficial book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is
referred to as of book Book Review: The Valley of Amazement. You can include your knowledge by it.
Without leaving the printed book, it might add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most
critical that, you must aware about publication. It can bring you from one destination to other place.

Donald Labelle:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got learners? We believe that that concern
was given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. And you also
know that little person like reading or as studying become their hobby. You need to understand that reading
is very important and book as to be the point. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge, except
your own personal teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update in relation to something by book.
Amount types of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them is niagra Book Review: The Valley
of Amazement.
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