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A complete, comparative and international handbook on the fundamental principles governing the protection,
conservation and sustainable utilization of the environment in Nigeria. The Principles of Nigerian
Environmental Law takes a comparative and international approach in analyzing and discussing the peculiar
approaches and tool-boxes for environmental protection in Nigeria. Starting with a theoretical and
jurisprudential examination of the term 'environment'; an examination of the schools of thoughts and
emerging paradigms in international environmental regulations, and the history and sources of Nigeria's
environmental law; it presents an exhaustive overview of the foundations upon which the current elaborate
structure of environmental law in Nigeria has been built. The book then moves to discuss the nature and
scope of laws designed to regulate specific environmental problems in Nigeria such as water pollution, air
pollution, marine pollution, oil spillage, gas flaring, climate change, stratospheric depletion of the ozone
layer and transboundary movement of hazardous wastes. The book provides environmental stakeholders
from all backgrounds including students, administrators, lawyers, government representatives, judges,
analysts and pundits, a ready tool to digest, assimilate, understand and appreciate the legal and institutional
framework for environmental regulation and protection in Nigeria. For anyone interested in learning about
the importance of law in the protection of the environment, this book would be your finest companion.
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From reader reviews:

Ronald Walker:

Book will be written, printed, or created for everything. You can realize everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important issue to bring us around the world.
Next to that you can your reading talent was fluently. A guide Principles of Nigerian Environmental Law
(Environmental Law) will make you to be smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if you can
know about every little thing. But some of you think this open or reading a book make you bored. It is not
necessarily make you fun. Why they could be thought like that? Have you trying to find best book or suited
book with you?

David Creason:

The publication with title Principles of Nigerian Environmental Law (Environmental Law) has lot of
information that you can find out it. You can get a lot of help after read this book. That book exist new
information the information that exist in this reserve represented the condition of the world currently. That is
important to yo7u to learn how the improvement of the world. This book will bring you with new era of the
globalization. You can read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Annie Resnick:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them loved ones or
their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV, or even playing
video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity here is look different you can read any
book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can spent all day every day to
reading a guide. The book Principles of Nigerian Environmental Law (Environmental Law) it is very good to
read. There are a lot of individuals who recommended this book. These were enjoying reading this book.
Should you did not have enough space to deliver this book you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore
quickly to read this book from the smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this book features high
quality.

Gary Lund:

Some people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt the idea when
they get a half elements of the book. You can choose the book Principles of Nigerian Environmental Law
(Environmental Law) to make your own reading is interesting. Your skill of reading talent is developing
when you including reading. Try to choose basic book to make you enjoy you just read it and mingle the idea
about book and examining especially. It is to be very first opinion for you to like to wide open a book and
study it. Beside that the e-book Principles of Nigerian Environmental Law (Environmental Law) can to be
your friend when you're experience alone and confuse using what must you're doing of their time.
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