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This book was compiled from contributions given at the 7th IAA Symposium on Small Satellites for Earth
Observation, May 4–8, 2009, Berlin (IAA – International Academy of Astronautics). From the 15 sessions
for oral presentations and two poster sessions, 52 contributions were selected which are representative for the
new developments and trends in the area of small satellites for Earth observation. They re ect the potentials
of a diversity of missions and related technologies. This may be based on national projects or international
co-operations, single satellites of constellations, pico-, nano-, micro- or mini-satellites, developed by
companies, research institutions or agencies. The main focus is on new missions to monitor our Earth’s
resources (Part I), and the environment in which our Earth is emb- ded (Part II). Part III deals with
distributed space systems, a unique feature of small satellites and in most cases impractical to do with large
satellites. Here we concentrate on constellations of satellites with focus on future missions relying on co-
operating satellites. For all the new developments and projects we need well e- cated specialists coming from
the universities. Many universities included already the development and implementation of small satellites
in their curriculum. The u- versity satellites chapter (Part IV) shows the high quality which is already
reached by some of the universities worldwide.
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From reader reviews:

David Pell:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the title Small Satellite
Missions for Earth Observation: New Developments and Trends suitable to you? Typically the book was
written by popular writer in this era. The particular book untitled Small Satellite Missions for Earth
Observation: New Developments and Trendsis a single of several books which everyone read now. That
book was inspired a lot of people in the world. When you read this book you will enter the new dimension
that you ever know before. The author explained their plan in the simple way, therefore all of people can
easily to understand the core of this book. This book will give you a large amount of information about this
world now. To help you see the represented of the world in this book.

Robert Prather:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book
consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a publication will give you a lot of
new data. When you read a reserve you will get new information due to the fact book is one of numerous
ways to share the information or perhaps their idea. Second, looking at a book will make anyone more
imaginative. When you studying a book especially fictional works book the author will bring you to imagine
the story how the people do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to some others. When you
read this Small Satellite Missions for Earth Observation: New Developments and Trends, you could tells
your family, friends along with soon about yours e-book. Your knowledge can inspire the others, make them
reading a publication.

Thomas Welty:

Why? Because this Small Satellite Missions for Earth Observation: New Developments and Trends is an
unordinary book that the inside of the publication waiting for you to snap the idea but latter it will distress
you with the secret that inside. Reading this book alongside it was fantastic author who all write the book in
such awesome way makes the content within easier to understand, entertaining way but still convey the
meaning totally. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this anymore or you going to regret it. This
unique book will give you a lot of advantages than the other book include such as help improving your
expertise and your critical thinking approach. So , still want to hesitate having that book? If I have been you I
will go to the publication store hurriedly.

Mary Mohammad:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library or to
make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's heart and soul or
real their passion. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to right now
there but nothing reading really. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring as well as can't see



colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we
know that on this era, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, ways to reach
Chinese's country. So , this Small Satellite Missions for Earth Observation: New Developments and Trends
can make you experience more interested to read.
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