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For the new breed of vacationer who craves meaningful trips and unusual locales, the combination of reading
and travel can be a heady mix—especially if you happen to be checking into Hemingway’s favorite hotel in
Sun Valley, or strolling about Bath’s Royal Crescent while entertaining fantasies of Lizzie Bennett and her
Mr. Darcy! Cue National Geographic’s Novel Destinations—a guide for bibliophiles to more than 500
literary sites across the United States and Europe.

The book begins with thematic chapters covering author houses and museums, literary festivals and walking
tours. Then, in-depth explorations of author and places take readers roaming Franz Kafka’s Prague, James
Joyce’s Dublin, Louisa May Alcott’s New England, and other locales. Peppered with great reading
suggestions and little-known tales of literary gossip, Novel Destinations is a unique travel guide, an attractive
gift book, and the ultimate browser’s delight.
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From reader reviews:

Randy Johnson:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also become a life style. This reading routine give
you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge even the information inside the
book that will improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of
publication you read, if you want drive more knowledge just go with training books but if you want sense
happy read one together with theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. Typically the Novel
Destinations: Literary Landmarks From Jane Austen's Bath to Ernest Hemingway's Key West is kind of e-
book which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Bobbi Wilkinson:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the spare time or they will get large
amount of stress from both lifestyle and work. So , whenever we ask do people have spare time, we will say
absolutely yes. People is human not a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity have you got when the
spare time coming to a person of course your answer can unlimited right. Then do you try this one, reading
textbooks. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, often the book you have read will be
Novel Destinations: Literary Landmarks From Jane Austen's Bath to Ernest Hemingway's Key West.

Robert Brown:

Reading a book being new life style in this year; every people loves to study a book. When you read a book
you can get a lot of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge, because book
has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what forms of book that you have
read. If you want to get information about your examine, you can read education books, but if you act like
you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, and soon. The
Novel Destinations: Literary Landmarks From Jane Austen's Bath to Ernest Hemingway's Key West provide
you with a new experience in reading a book.

Michael Santiago:

You will get this Novel Destinations: Literary Landmarks From Jane Austen's Bath to Ernest Hemingway's
Key West by visit the bookstore or Mall. Only viewing or reviewing it might to be your solve trouble if you
get difficulties for your knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are various. Not only by means of written or
printed but in addition can you enjoy this book by means of e-book. In the modern era such as now, you just
looking of your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your current ways to get
more information about your guide. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still
change. Let's try to choose right ways for you.
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